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When in Puerto Rico, you can always continue with your sessions of golf if you decide to go with the
Gran MeliÃ¡ Puerto Rico as your choice of accommodation. This resort is situated just half hour
away from Luis MuÃ±oz MarÃ­n International Airport and is snugly nestled in the Coco Beach in RÃ­o
Grande. It is bang opposite Trump International Golf Club and around 30 minutes away from Luis
Munoz MarÃ­n International Airport.

There are levels to staying at the Gran MeliÃ¡ in terms of amenities and service you receive. The
Royal Service is the top most and provides you with everything that you need in an exclusive
environment. The resort has on call all through the day and week a pharmacy as well as medical
staff. One can also organize a range of excursions with the help of the hotel staff. And of course for
those who want to play a good round of golf, the two 18-hole championship courses located at the
Trump International Golf Club are simply spectacular. As a guest at Gran MeliÃ¡ you will be entitled
to special green fees, tee times as well as some private classes and club storage. You will find that
there are 10 more courses that can be accessed within a 30 miles radius.

The place has ample parking place and the staff is very well versed in looking after their guests. The
place may need a little looking after in terms of its landscaping. The rooms are very well kept and
though you may want an HD TV in your room, you will have make do with analog TVs do the job.

If you can afford to, it would be best to opt for Red Level service here. You get the presidential suite
and your own cabana bed and private pool. It even comes with a guest room if you so want to use it.
The suite also has its own set of butlers who will wait on you hand and foot. They are extremely
punctual with all the requests that are made of them. You could also request for a hammock to be
placed around your villa between the palm trees that are there.

The best part about this place is that it is completely in keeping with the laidback attitude that is
present all around Puerto Rico. When you stay here it would be best to hire a car to take you
around, as you are placed a little away in the island.
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Simon C Parker - About Author:
Do you ever want to visit beautiful and enjoy vacations in best a Puerto Rico hotels? Just go online
and check out the lalest a Puerto Rico resorts packages, Hotels and flights on our website. Travel
and see unforgettable view of a puerto rico beaches and make it most memorable vacations.
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