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Linen fabric is very soft and smooth to the touch. Made from the natural fibers of the flax plant, linen
is a favorite among the people who live in hot and humid climate. It absorbs moisture very well and
dries as quickly, leaving the wearer of linen garment cool at all times. But these same
characteristics of linen also make it a favorite with the lady of the house for very different reasons.
Linen is widely used inside the kitchen, so much so, that any cloth being used inside the kitchen is
referred to as â€œkitchen linenâ€• irrespective of what it is made. It is used as table cloths and hence they
are also referred to as â€œtable linenâ€•.

Linen table cloths make for not only an affordable but also a practical choice. When used on the
dining table, it becomes an easy target for any kind of stains and that too almost everyday.
Naturally, it requires daily cleaning and washing with harsh detergents. Linen can withstand this
abrasion well. But being light by its nature, it is not difficult to wash or rinse them even by hand. It
also does not stain very easily. After it is washed, it has to be starched and ironed while it is still
damp. And then you will have your crisp, linen table cloth to be laid on the table with all its glory. If
properly maintained, they can last for quite a few years.

There are those who prefer spotless white table cloths, and those who want to add color through
them. In that case, you can easily choose from a wide array of printed or embroidered table cloths.
Linen, being a delicate fabric, is well suited to light pastel shades and the breeziness lends it a
degree of freshness which spreads through the room. While washing them, it is essential that they
be washed with relatively lighter detergents and be hung in the shade to dry. Linen table cloths can
also be used on the center tables and on low racks. They make a perfect backdrop for any other
item of dÃ©cor that might be kept on them.

Linen table cloths can also be bought in a set, which makes it further easier on the pockets. Buying
linen table cloths will definitely add to the variety of the dining or living room. Guests will really like
this simple yet colorful manner of decoration.
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